
GRACE COMMUNITY BIBLE FELLOWSHIP

THANKSGIVING AND WORSHIP SERVICE

October 7, 2018

9:45 a.m. Fellowship Breakfast

10:15 a.m. Prayer

Scripture Reading: Psalm 89

Songs of Praise, Worship and Thanksgiving

Take Us to the River
Hallelujah What A Savior
Worthy Is the Lamb
I Will Sing the Wondrous Story

The Lord’s Supper

Scripture Reading: John 2:1-12

Sermon: A Wedding in Cana - The First of Signs

Prayer

If you have questions or comments about today’s sermon, please feel free to
contact me at 758-4400.

Jim Flaherty, pastor
       gracecbf.org

Scripture References

Genesis 14:17 Then after his return from the defeat of Chedorlaomer
and the kings who were with him, the king of Sodom went out to meet
him at the valley of Shaveh (that is, the King’s Valley). 18 And
Melchizedek king of Salem brought out bread and wine; now he was a
priest of God Most High.

Numbers 6:20 ‘Then the priest shall wave them for a wave offering
before the LORD. It is holy for the priest, together with the breast
offered by waving and the thigh offered by lifting up; and afterward
the Nazirite may drink wine.’

Psalm 104:15 And wine which makes man’s heart glad, So that he
may make his face glisten with oil, And food which sustains man’s
heart.

Matthew 11:19 “The Son of Man came eating and drinking, and they
say, ‘Behold, a gluttonous man and a drunkard, a friend of tax
collectors and sinners!’ Yet wisdom is vindicated by her deeds.”

Leviticus 10:8 The LORD then spoke to Aaron, saying, 9 “Do not
drink wine or strong drink, neither you nor your sons with you, when
you come into the tent of meeting, so that you will not die - it is a
perpetual statute throughout your generations -

Proverbs 31:4 It is not for kings, O Lemuel, It is not for kings to drink
wine, Or for rulers to desire strong drink, 5 For they will drink and
forget what is decreed, And pervert the rights of all the afflicted.

Ecclesiastes 10:17 Blessed are you, O land, whose king is of nobility
and whose princes eat at the appropriate time - for strength and not for
drunkenness.

Isaiah 28:7 And these also reel with wine and stagger from strong
drink: The priest and the prophet reel with strong drink,     They are
confused by wine, they stagger from strong drink; They reel while
having visions, They totter when rendering judgment.



1 Timothy 3:8 Deacons likewise must be men of dignity, not
double-tongued, or addicted to much wine or fond of sordid gain,

1 Timothy 5:23 No longer drink water exclusively, but use a little
wine for the sake of your stomach and your frequent ailments.

Luke 1:26 Now in the sixth month the angel Gabriel was sent from
God to a city in Galilee called Nazareth, 27 to a virgin engaged to a
man whose name was Joseph, of the descendants of David; and the
virgin’s name was Mary. 28 And coming in, he said to her,
“Greetings, favored one! The Lord is with you.” 29 But she was very
perplexed at this statement, and kept pondering what kind of
salutation this was. 30 The angel said to her, “Do not be afraid, Mary;
for you have found favor with God. 31 “And behold, you will
conceive in your womb and bear a son, and you shall name Him
Jesus. 32 “He will be great and will be called the Son of the Most
High; and the Lord God will give Him the throne of His father David;
33 and He will reign over the house of Jacob forever, and His
kingdom will have no end.” 34 Mary said to the angel, “How can this
be, since I am a virgin?” 35 The angel answered and said to her, “The
Holy Spirit will come upon you, and the power of the Most High will
overshadow you; and for that reason the holy Child shall be called the
Son of God. 

Luke 2:8 In the same region there were some shepherds staying out in
the fields and keeping watch over their flock by night. 9 And an angel
of the Lord suddenly stood before them, and the glory of the Lord
shone around them; and they were terribly frightened. 10 But the
angel said to them, “Do not be afraid; for behold, I bring you good
news of great joy which will be for all the people; 11 for today in the
city of David there has been born for you a Savior, who is Christ the
Lord. 12 “This will be a sign for you: you will find a baby wrapped in
cloths and lying in a manger.” 13 And suddenly there appeared with
the angel a multitude of the heavenly host praising God and saying,
14 “Glory to God in the highest, And on earth peace among men with
whom He is pleased.” 15 When the angels had gone away from them
into heaven, the shepherds began saying to one another, “Let us go
straight to Bethlehem then, and see this thing that has happened which

the Lord has made known to us.” 16 So they came in a hurry and
found their way to Mary and Joseph, and the baby as He lay in the
manger. 17 When they had seen this, they made known the statement
which had been told them about this Child. 18 And all who heard it
wondered at the things which were told them by the shepherds. 19 But
Mary treasured all these things, pondering them in her heart.

Luke 2:25 And there was a man in Jerusalem whose name was
Simeon; and this man was righteous and devout, looking for the
consolation of Israel; and the Holy Spirit was upon him. 26 And it had
been revealed to him by the Holy Spirit that he would not see death
before he had seen the Lord’s Christ. 27 And he came in the Spirit
into the temple; and when the parents brought in the child Jesus, to
carry out for Him the custom of the Law, 28 then he took Him into his
arms, and blessed God, and said, 29 “Now Lord, You are releasing
Your bond-servant to depart in peace, According to Your word; 30
For my eyes have seen Your salvation, 31 Which You have prepared
in the presence of all peoples, 32 A LIGHT OF REVELATION TO
THE GENTILES,  And the glory of Your people Israel.”  33 And His
father and mother were amazed at the things which were being said
about Him. 34 And Simeon blessed them and said to Mary His
mother, “Behold, this Child is appointed for the fall and rise of many
in Israel, and for a sign to be opposed -  35 and a sword will pierce
even your own soul - to the end that thoughts from many hearts may
be revealed.”

Matthew 12:46 While He was still speaking to the crowds, behold,
His mother and brothers were standing outside, seeking to speak to
Him. 47 Someone said to Him, “Behold, Your mother and Your
brothers are standing outside seeking to speak to You.” 48 But Jesus
answered the one who was telling Him and said, “Who is My mother
and who are My brothers?” 49 And stretching out His hand toward
His disciples, He said, “Behold My mother and My brothers! 50 “For
whoever does the will of My Father who is in heaven, he is My
brother and sister and mother.”


